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Nondiscrimination Statement 

I. The following nondiscrimination statement must appear on all vital documents 
that impact program participation:   

In accordance with federal civil rights law and U.S. Department of Agriculture 
(USDA) civil rights regulations and policies, this institution is prohibited from 
discriminating on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex (including gender 
identity and sexual orientation), disability, age, or reprisal or retaliation for prior 
civil rights activity. 
 
Program information may be made available in languages other than English. 
Persons with disabilities who require alternative means of communication to 
obtain program information (e.g., Braille, large print, audiotape, American Sign 
Language), should contact the responsible state or local agency that administers 
the program or USDA’s TARGET Center at (202) 720-2600 (voice and TTY) or 
contact USDA through the Federal Relay Service at (800) 877-8339. 
 
To file a program discrimination complaint, a Complainant should complete a 
Form AD-3027, USDA Program Discrimination Complaint Form which can be 
obtained online at: https://www.usda.gov/sites/default/files/documents/ad-
3027.pdf, from any USDA office, by calling (866) 632-9992, or by writing a letter 
addressed to USDA. The letter must contain the complainant’s name, address, 
telephone number, and a written description of the alleged discriminatory action 
in sufficient detail to inform the Assistant Secretary for Civil Rights (ASCR) about 
the nature and date of an alleged civil rights violation. The completed AD-3027 
form or letter must be submitted to USDA by: 
 
(1)  mail: U.S. Department of Agriculture 

Office of the Assistant Secretary for Civil Rights 
1400 Independence Avenue, SW 
Washington, D.C. 20250-9410; or 

 
(2)  fax: (833) 256-1665 or (202) 690-7442; or 
 
(3)  email: program.intake@usda.gov. 
 
This institution is an equal opportunity provider. 

 
Spanish 

De conformidad con la Ley Federal de Derechos Civiles y los reglamentos y 
políticas de derechos civiles del Departamento de Agricultura de los EE. UU. 
(USDA, por sus siglas en inglés), se prohíbe que el USDA, sus agencias, 
oficinas, empleados e instituciones que participan o administran programas del 
USDA discriminen sobre la base de raza, color, nacionalidad, sexo, 
discapacidad, edad, o en represalia o venganza por actividades previas de 
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derechos civiles en algún programa o actividad realizados o financiados por el 
USDA.  
 
Las personas con discapacidades que necesiten medios alternativos para la 
comunicación de la información del programa (por ejemplo, sistema Braille, 
letras grandes, cintas de audio, lenguaje de señas americano, etc.), deben 
ponerse en contacto con la agencia (estatal o local) en la que solicitaron los 
beneficios. Las personas sordas, con dificultades de audición o discapacidades 
del habla pueden comunicarse con el USDA por medio del Federal Relay 
Service [Servicio Federal de Retransmisión] al (800) 877-8339. Además, la 
información del programa se puede proporcionar en otros idiomas. 
 
Para presentar una denuncia de discriminación, complete el Formulario de 
Denuncia de Discriminación del Programa del USDA, (AD-3027) que está 
disponible en línea en: https://www.usda.gov/sites/default/files/documents/ad-
3027s.pdf y en cualquier oficina del USDA, o bien escriba una carta dirigida al 
USDA e incluya en la carta toda la información solicitada en el formulario. Para 
solicitar una copia del formulario de denuncia, llame al (866) 632-9992. Haga 
llegar su formulario lleno o carta al USDA por:  
 
(1) correo: U.S. Department of Agriculture  

Office of the Assistant Secretary for Civil Rights  
1400 Independence Avenue, SW  
Washington, D.C. 20250-9410;  

 
(2) fax: (202) 690-7442; o  
 
(3) correo electrónico: program.intake@usda.gov. 
 
Esta entidad es un proveedor que brinda igualdad de oportunidades. 
 

II. The required font size for the non-discrimination statement is 11 point or larger. It 
must be printed in a standard font in black or other dark color. 
 

III. If the material is too small for the full statement (a single page document, post 
card, etc.) you may print the abbreviated statement its place, “This institution is 
an equal opportunity provider.” This statement should be in print size no 
smaller than the text of the document. 
 

IV. When providing information for radio and television public service 
announcements, the nondiscrimination statement does not have to be read in its 
entirety. Rather, the abbreviated statement “This institution is an equal 
opportunity provider” is sufficient to meet the nondiscrimination requirement. 
 

V. The statements should be in English and in languages appropriate to the local 
population, and upon request, in Braille, large print, audiotape, etc. 
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VI. State and local agency WIC websites must contain the current nondiscrimination 
statement. At a minimum, the nondiscrimination statement or a link to it must be 
included on the home page of the WIC program information. 
 

VII. The nondiscrimination statement is required if the material: 
 

a. Describes eligibility requirements of the WIC Program, 
 

b. Identifies the benefits of WIC participation, 
 

c. Gives instructions for WIC participation, 
 

d. Provides notice of conditions to continue eligibility, and/or 
 

e. Provides notice of ineligibility or disqualification. 
 

VIII. Nutrition education and breastfeeding promotion and support materials that 
strictly provide a nutrition message with no mention of WIC (as described above) 
are not required to contain the nondiscrimination statement. 
 

IX. Assurance of Civil Rights Compliance. All contracts between the WIC Program 
and sub recipients of the program at the state and local agency levels must 
contain an assurance of civil rights compliance. The language to be included is 
not the nondiscrimination statement from above, but is the language that follows 
below:  
 
The State Agency hereby agrees that it will comply with Title VI of the Civil Rights 
Act of 1964 (42 U.S.C. 2000d et seq.), Title IX of the Education Amendments of 
1972 (20 U.S.C. 1681 et seq.), Section 504 of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973 (29 
U.S.C. 794), Age Discrimination Act of 1975 (42 U.S.C. 6101 et seq.); Title II and 
Title III of the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) of 1990 as amended by the 
ADA Amendment Act of 2008 (42 U.S.C. 12131-12189) as implemented by 
Department of Justice regulations at (28 CFR Parts 35 and 36); Executive Order 
13166, "Improving Access to Services for Persons with Limited English 
Proficiency." (August 11, 2000), all provisions required by the implementing 
regulations of the U.S. Department of Agriculture (7 CFR Part 15 et seq); and 
FNS directives and guidelines to the effect that no person shall, on the ground of 
race, color, national origin, age, sex, or disability, be excluded from participation 
in, be denied the benefits of, or otherwise be subjected to discrimination under 
any program or activity for which the Agency receives Federal financial 
assistance from FNS; and hereby gives assurance that it will immediately take 
measures necessary to effectuate this agreement. 
By providing this assurance, the State Agency agrees to compile data, maintain 
records and submit records and reports as required to permit effective 
enforcement of the nondiscrimination laws, and to permit Department personnel 
during normal working hours to review and copy such records, books and 
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accounts, access such facilities, and interview such personnel as needed to 
ascertain compliance with the non-discrimination laws. If there are any violations 
of this assurance, the Department of Agriculture shall have the right to seek 
judicial enforcement of this assurance. 
This assurance is given in consideration of and for the purpose of obtaining any 
and all Federal financial assistance, grants, and loans of Federal funds, 
reimbursable expenditures, grant, or donation of Federal property and interest in 
property, the detail of Federal personnel, the sale and lease of, and the 
permission to use Federal property or interest in such property or the furnishing 
of services without consideration or at a nominal consideration, or at a 
consideration that is reduced for the purpose of assisting the recipient, or in 
recognition of the public interest to be served by such sale, lease, or furnishing of 
services to the recipient, or any improvements made with Federal financial 
assistance extended to the Program applicant by USDA. This includes any 
Federal agreement, arrangement, or other contract that has as one of its 
purposes the provision of cash assistance for the purchase of food, and cash 
assistance for purchase or rental of food service equipment or any other financial 
assistance extended in reliance on the representations and agreements made in 
this assurance. 
This assurance is binding on the State Agency, its successors, transferees, and 
assignees as long as it receives assistance or retains possession of any 
assistance from the Department. The person or persons whose signatures 
appear below are authorized to sign this assurance on the behalf of the State 
Agency. 
 

a. The term “State Agency” in the above language can be substituted to the 
appropriate entity for which the contract is written. 

 


